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Facsimile: 850/983-5133 
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6544 Firehouse Road, Milton, Florida 32570-3411 

CPPO, CPPB 
Director of Purchasing and Contract Administration 

Judson C. Crane 

   
                      

             
DISTRICT 1 DISTRICT 2 DISTRICT 3 DISTRICT 4 DISTRICT 5 

Diane Scott          Clifton L. Hinote Carol Boston Jennifer Granse Scott Peden 
 

February 16, 2017    
 
 
 
 
Tim Wyrosdick 
Superintendent of Schools 
5086 Canal Street 
Milton, Florida 32570-6707 
 
Dear Mr. Wyrosdick, 
 
The selection committee for RFP 16-09 County Wide Cabinets, ranked the proposals by D & R Woodworking of 
NW FL and Elmore Millwork LLC as the top companies to be awarded.   Approval is recommended. 
 
The RFP 16-09 documents and information can be reviewed at this link: 
RFP Documents 
 
 
The selection committee consisted of the following:  
 
Richard Laing, Supervisor of Building Maintenance 
Rufus Phillips, Maintenance Foreman 
Richard Grimes, Maintenance Foreman 
Jerry Davis, Maintenance Mechanic II 
James Shelby, Maintenance Mechanic II 
 
 
 
 
Sincerely, 
 
 

  
Judson C. Crane 
JCC/cl 
 
Att: 3 
 
 
 
 
Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security  
required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes. 
 
 
 

https://sites.santarosa.k12.fl.us/purchasing/bids/2016/16-09_Cabinets/RFP_16-09.htm


RFP 16-09   County Wide Cabinets
RFP Intended Award Date:  February 9, 2017
RFP Award Date:  February 16, 2017
Contract Start Date: February 17, 2017
Contract End Date:   February 16, 2022
Dual Award:    D & R Woodworking of NW FL  &   Elmore Millwork LLC

D & R Woodworking
 of Northwest Fl Inc Elmore Millwork LLC Fisher Cabinet Co., LLC
5614 Cyanamid Rd 211 E Brent Lance, Unit B 3900 N Palafox street

Milton, FL 32583 Pensacola, FL  32503 Pensacola, FL  32505

    1.  Removal of existing cabinets $20.00 $15.00 $25.00
Price Price Price

B. Laminate Casework Cabinets: per Cabinet per Cabinet per Cabinet
2.       Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash             
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
3.       Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with Corian counter top and backsplash             
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
4.       Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with laminate counter top and backsplash             
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
5.       Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
6.       Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
7.       Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
8.       Base Cabinet with sink cutout, 2 doors, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash;       
District will supply and install sink.            Width:  24"to 36"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 
30" to 36"

$660.00 $819.00 $920.00

9.       Base Cabinet with sink cutout, 2 doors, with Corian counter top and backsplash;      
District will supply and install sink.            Width:  24"to 36"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 
30" to 36"

$679.00 $986.00 $920.00

10.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"
11.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"
12.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"

13.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash

Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
14.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
15.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
16.    Poster Board Storage Cabinet: 2 full height doors with locks, includes eight  1” thick 
adjustable shelves
Width:  48”     Depth:   30”       Height:  84" 
17.    Computer station counter top:  Solid Surface counter top with support brackets and 1 
grommet station         Width:  32"       Depth: 30” $440.00 $435.00 $734.00

18.    Computer station counter top:  Corian counter top with support brackets and 1 grommet 
station         
Width:  32"       Depth: 30”
19.    Computer station counter top:  laminate counter top with support brackets and 1 
grommet station         Width:  32"     Depth: 30” $240.00 $190.00 $235.00

20.    Upper Cabinet:   2 doors            Width: 24" to 36"     Depth: 13"    Height:   24" to 30" $345.00 $240.00 $360.00

21.    Base Cubby Cabinet:  with adjustable shelves         
Width: 24” to 36”      Depth: 24”       Finished Height: 30” to 36”
22.    Open Shelf cabinet unit:    with four 1” thick adjustable shelves and one 1” thick fixed 
shelf
Width: 24” to 36”     Depth:   24”      Height:  84”
23.    Shelf cabinet unit:   2 doors with locks, includes four 1” thick adjustable shelves and one 
1” thick fixed shelf
Width: 24” to 36”     Depth:   24”      Height:  84”

$744.00

$480.00

$635.00

$650.00

$470.00

$980.00

$569.00

$1,213.00

$1,213.00

$683.00

$956.00

$574.00 $559.00

$831.00 $966.00

$998.00 $966.00

$1,179.00

A.  Removal Price Per Linear Foot (L.F.)

$635.00

$654.00

$390.00

$725.00

$1,000.00

$630.00

$1,370.00

$460.00

$525.00

$675.00

Price Per Linear Foot (L.F.)

$631.00

$898.00

$674.00

$1,460.00

$1,101.00

$1,324.00

$892.00

884

$798.00 $884.00

$474.00 $487.00

$731.00 $956.00

$950.00 $905.00

$598.00

$506.00 $734.00

$394.00 362
 with 2 shelves

$991.00 $755.00

Price Per Linear Foot (L.F.)



Price Price Price
C.  All Wood Cabinets; Maple ¾” Furniture Grade Plywood: Per Cabinet Per Cabinet Per Cabinet
        (Prices to include doors with slab fronts unless noted otherwise.)

24.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
25.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
26.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
27.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
28.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
29.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
30.    Base Cabinet with sink cut out, 2 doors, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash            
District will supply and install sink.            Width:  24"to 36"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 
30" to 36"

$660.00 $869.00 No Bid

31.    Base Cabinet with sink cut out, 2 doors, with Corian counter top and backsplash    
District will supply and install sink.                     Width:  24"to 36"  Depth: 24"   Finished 
Height: 30" to 36"

$680.00 $1,036.00 No Bid

32.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"
33.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"
34.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"
35.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
36.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
37.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
38.    Poster Board Storage Cabinet: 2 full height doors with locks, includes eight  1” thick 
adjustable shelves                    Width:  48”     Depth:   30”       Height:  84" $1,370.00 $1,535.00 No Bid

39.    Computer station counter top:  Solid Surface counter top with support brackets and 1 
grommet station 
Width:  32"      Depth: 30”      
40.    Computer station counter top:  Corian counter top with support brackets and 1 grommet 
station 
Width:  32"       Depth: 30”  
41.    Computer station counter top:  laminate counter top with support brackets and 1 
grommet station 
Width:  32"       Depth: 30”  
42.    Upper Cabinet:   2 doors                     Width: 24" to 36"     Depth: 13"    Height:   24" to 
30" $330.00 $290.00 No Bid

43.    Upper Cabinet:   2 doors                     Width: 24" to 36"     Depth: 13"    Height:   24" to 
30"
Price to include doors with “arched raised” panel doors.
44.    Base Cubby Cabinet:  with adjustable shelves
Width: 24” to 36”      Depth: 24”       Finished Height: 30” to 36”
45.    Open Shelf cabinet unit:    with four 1” thick adjustable shelves and one 1” thick fixed 
shelf                             Width: 24” to 36”     Depth:   24”      Height:  84” $750.00 $1,091.00 No Bid

46.    Shelf cabinet unit:   2 doors with locks, includes four 1” thick adjustable shelves and one 
1” thick fixed shelf             Width: 24” to 36”     Depth:   24”      Height:  84” $980.00 $1,279.00 No Bid

D.  All Wood Cabinets; Birch ¾” Furniture Grade Plywood:
       (Prices to include doors with slab fronts unless noted otherwise.)

47.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash

Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
48.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
49.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, no drawers, with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth:  24"    Finished Height:  30" to 36"
50.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
51.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"

$390.00

$725.00

$745.00

Price Per Cabinet

$650.00

$670.00

$405.00

$740.00

$760.00

$630.00

$440.00

$460.00

$240.00

$450.00

$525.00

$480.00

$635.00

$650.00

$470.00

$980.00

$1,000.00

$635.00

$655.00

$681.00 No Bid

$848.00 No Bid

$624.00 No Bid

$906.00 No Bid

$1,073.00 No Bid

$524.00 No Bid

$781.00 No Bid

$948.00 No Bid

$967.00 No Bid

$435.00 No Bid

$506.00 No Bid

$967.00 No Bid

$1,176.00 No Bid

$1,399.00 No Bid

Price Per Cabinet Price Per Cabinet

$681.00 No Bid

$848.00 No Bid

$190.00 No Bid

$365.00 No Bid

$469.00 No Bid

$524.00 No Bid

$781.00 No Bid

$948.00 No Bid



52.    Base Cabinet: 2 doors, 2 drawers, with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 24" to 36"   Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
53.    Base Cabinet with sink cut out, 2 doors, with Solid Surface counter top and 
backsplash          District will supply and install sink.                     Width:  24"to 36"  Depth: 
24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"      

$445.00 $869.00 No Bid

54.    Base Cabinet with sink cut out, 2 doors, with Corian counter top and built-in 
backsplash         District will supply and install sink.                 Width:  24"to 36"  Depth: 
24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"  

$475.00 $1,036.00 No Bid

55.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"
56.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"
57.    Base Cabinet: 4 drawers with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width:  24" to 30"  Depth: 24"  Finished Height: 30" to 36"

58.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with Solid Surface counter top and backsplash

Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
59.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with Corian counter top and backsplash
Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
60.    Poster Board Base Cabinet:  4 drawers with laminate counter top and backsplash
Width: 36" to 48"  Depth: 24"   Finished Height: 30" to 36"
61.    Poster Board Storage Cabinet: 2 full height doors with locks, includes eight  1” thick 
adjustable shelves
Width:48”     Depth:   30”       Height:  84”
62.    Computer station counter top:  Solid Surface counter top with support brackets and 1 
grommet station 
Width:  32"       Depth: 30”      
63.    Computer station counter top:  Corian counter top with support brackets and 1 
grommet station 
Width:  32"     Depth: 30”     
64.    Computer station counter top:  laminate counter top counter top with support brackets 
and 1 grommet station 
Width:  32"    Depth: 30”     
65.    Upper Cabinet:   2 doors               Width: 24" to 36"     Depth: 13"    Height:   24" to 
30" $345.00 $290.00 No Bid

66.    Upper Cabinet:   2 doors               Width: 24" to 36"     Depth: 13"    Height:   24" to 
30"
Price to include doors with “arched raised” panel doors.
67.    Base Cubby Cabinet:  with adjustable shelves
Width: 24” to 36”      Depth: 24”       Finished Height: 30” to 36”
68.    Open Shelf cabinet unit:    with four 1” thick adjustable shelves and one 1” thick fixed 
shelf             
Width: 24” to 36”     Depth:   24”      Height:  84”
69.    Shelf cabinet unit:   2 doors with locks, includes four 1” thick adjustable shelves and 
one 1” thick fixed shelf
Width: 24” to 36”     Depth:   24”      Height:  84”

Sample Job Cost Pricing $6,860.00 $4,333.00 $7,350.00

All sink cutouts are 
priced for drop-in sinks
Additional hourly rate 
for work that is beyond 
the normal daily work 
schedule, add $30.00 
per man hour.

Warranty: 1 year
1 yr craftsmanship; 

10 yrs material defects 3 year 

"Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or 
failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a

bond shall constitute a waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes."

$995.00

$250.00

$465.00

$645.00

$1,410.00

$440.00

$460.00

$495.00

$750.00

$770.00

$480.00

$995.00

$1,015.00

$540.00

$765.00

No Bid

$624.00 No Bid

$906.00 No Bid

$1,073.00 No Bid

$469.00 No Bid

$1,091.00 No Bid

$1,279.00 No Bid

$506.00 No Bid

$190.00 No Bid

$365.00 No Bid

$967.00 No Bid

$1,535.00 No Bid

$435.00 No Bid

$967.00 No Bid

$1,176.00 No Bid

$1,399.00
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