
Bid:  12-04

Bid Name: Milk

Bid Intended Award Date: May 17, 2012

Bid Award Date: May 24, 2012

Company: Butler Foods Butler Foods Borden Dairy Borden Diary Last Bid: 07-08 Last Bid: 07-08

Cantonment, FL Cantonment, FL Cowarts, AL Cowarts, AL  Butler  Butler

Cardboard Plastic Cardboard Plastic Cardboard Plastic

Container Container Container Container Container Container

Product Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents

  

1 HOMOGENIZED MILK:  Whole Milk .2300 No Bid .2600 No Bid 0.205 No Bid

ESTIMATED USAGE:  3,927  ½ pints per year

FIRM PRICE for ½ pint, 4 deliveries per week:

2 LOW FAT MILK:  Butter fat content 1% .1950 No Bid .2450 .2850 .1950 .2306

ESTIMATED USAGE:  402,,439  ½ pints per year

FIRM PRICE for ½ pint, 4 deliveries per week:   
3 NON FAT CHOCOLATE MILK: Butter fat content 1% .1950 No Bid .2370 .2770

ESTIMATED USAGE:  1,181,073  ½ pints per year

FIRM PRICE for ½ pint, 4 deliveries per week: 

4 SKIM MILK: White milk, Butter fat content  1% .2200 No Bid .2400 .2800 .2050 .2287

ESTIMATED USAGE:  2,909  ½ pints per year

FIRM PRICE for ½ pint, 4 deliveries per week:

5 NON FAT STRAWBERRY MILK: Butter fat content, 1%  .2000 No Bid .23700 .2770

ESTIMATED USAGE:  231,484  ½ pints per year

FIRM PRICE for ½ pint, 4 deliveries per week:  

6  LOW FAT  HOMOGENIZED MILK: Butter fat content, 1% No Bid *.6700 (non fat) No Bid No Bid .1950 .02306

  ESTIMATED USAGE:  29,232  ½ pints per year

FIRM PRICE for 1 pint, 4 deliveries per week

7 NON FAT CHOCOLATE MILK:  Butter fat content 1% No Bid *.6800 (low fat) No Bid No Bid

ESTIMATED USAGE:  6,186  ½ pints per year

FIRM PRICE for Chug 1 pint, 4 deliveries per week

*Alternate

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a 

waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes
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Company: Butler Foods Butler Foods Borden Dairy Borden Diary Last Bid: 07-08 Last Bid: 07-08

Cantonment, FL Cantonment, FL Cowarts, AL Cowarts, AL  Butler  Butler

Cardboard Plastic Cardboard Plastic Cardboard Plastic

Container Container Container Container Container Container

Product Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents Cost in Cents

  

Cost in Dollars Cost in Dollars Cost in Dollars Cost in Dollars Cost in Dollars Cost in Dollars

8 BUTTERMILK:  ½ Gallon containers, No Fat No Bid 1.8900 No Bid 1.60 No Bid 1.75 

ESTIMATED USAGE:  1,115  ½ gal. per year

FIRM PRICE for ½ gallon containers, 4 deliveries per week

9 WHIPPING CREAM:  1 Quart containers, 36% Butter Fat 3.9500 No Bid No Bid 2.90 4.9500 No Bid

ESTIMATED USAGE:  12 Quarts per year

FIRM PRICE for 1 quart containers, 4 deliveries per week

10 COTTAGE CHEESE:  5 lb. container, LS, 1% low fat No Bid 6.9500 No Bid 7.50 No Bid 6.85 

ESTIMATED USAGE:  374  5 lb containers

FIRM PRICE for 5 lb. containers, 4 deliveries per week

11 SOUR CREAM:  5 lb container No Bid 5.9500 No Bid 7.00 No Bid 5.95 

ESTIMATED USAGE:  485  5 lb containers

FIRM PRICE for 5 lb. containers, 4 deliveries per week  
12 NON DAIRY MILK SUBSTITUTE:  No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

Minimal nutrition standards per cup

Calcium 276 mg, Protein 8g, Vitamin A 500 IU, Vitamin D 100 IU, 

Magnesium 24mg, Phosphorus 222mg,  Potassium 349 mg, 

Riboflavin  .44mg, Vitamin B-12 1.1mcg

ESTIMATED USAGE:  2070  ½ Pints per year

**Note:  Semi Annual price adjustments are made per the 

Department of Agriculture class one announcement of price per 

100 weight

*Alternate

Payment Discounts None None None None

 

Failure to file a protest within the time prescribed in section 120.57(3), Florida Statutes, or failure to post the bond or other security required by law within the time allowed for filing a bond shall constitute a 

waiver of proceedings under chapter 120, Florida Statutes


